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Product Descrpton Applcaton

It is universial concentrated pıgment 
paste.

It is not known as a classic tinting 
colored system paint it is concentrated 
pigment paste for light, highly resistan 
and  hard exterior conditions.

With high coloring power to be 
obtained with a small amount of the 
desired color is achieved.

Concentrate on reducing inventory 
cost structure provides economy.

All kinds of coating materials, can be 
colored without disturbing feature.

Does not dry in packaging.

Hanger with 60 colors offered in your 
imagination and color according to 
your knowledge recognizes the 
possibility of creating an infinite 
number of colors.

Can be used for coloring  white 
water-based decorative paints, 
p lasters ,undercoat ,water-based 
industrial paint and varnish transpa-
rent materials such as lacquer and 
grouts.

Shake the bottle well before use. 
Should be added  for colorants, 
emulsion based paints maximum 10%, 
for synthetic-based paints 5-8%, for 
varnish, lacquer and transparent paint 
3-5%. Should be added first colorants 
later thinner for white paint.

The remaining concentrate in the 
mouth with paint thinner to be added 
to the dye containers being discharged 
colouring

Bottle should be tightly closed to 
prevent drying after use.

Concentrated pigment paste is not 
used alone. Only by addition to paints 
or coating materials to be used.

More than one of the same color to 
color when it comes to packaging, to 
avoid gradation of colored paint is 
recommended for blending.

BEKOMIX
UNIVERSAL TUBE

Technical Specifications:

Color Safety Warnings

S2: Keep out of the reach of children.
S24 / 25: Avoid contact with eyes and 
skin.
S26: In case of contact with eyes, rinse 
immediately with plenty of water and 
seek medical advice.
S28: In case of contact with eyes, rinse 
immediately with plenty of water.
S29: Do not discharge into drains or 
water courses.
S46: If swallowed, seek medical 
advice immediately, and show the 
container or label.

Product Code: 385

24 Pcs.


